



## Committee - ARM

AGENDA	TITLE	DATE
1.3	<b>1. Introduction</b> ARM10-1.3.1 Provisional Agenda	14 Oct 2019
	3.0 Input paper template	12 Jul 2019
1.5	<b>1.5. Programme for the week</b> ARM10-1.5 Programme for the Week	11 Oct 2019
2.1.1	<b>2. Review of action items from last meeting</b> ARM10-2.1.1 Action items from ARM9	04 Aug 2019
2.1.2	<b>2. Review of action items from last meeting</b> ARM10-2.1.2 Report 9th Session IALA ARM Committee	04 Aug 2019
3.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.1 Liaison to ARM and VTS - Maritime Services in the context of e-Navigation (ENAV23-12.1.3)	04 Aug 2019
3.1.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.1.1 a lay-persons description of e-Navigation (ENAV23-12.1.4)	04 Aug 2019
3.2	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.2 Liason Note to ARM - Maritime Resource Names (MRN) (ENAV23-12.1.5)	04 Aug 2019
3.2.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.2.1 IHO Level Guidance on how to manage the IHO Maritime Resource Names (MRN) (ENAV23-12.1.5.1)	04 Aug 2019
3.3	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.3 Liaison Note to ARM and VTS on R-Mode (ENAV23-12.1.13)	04 Aug 2019
3.3.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.3.1 R-Mode Stakeholder Requirements (ENAV23-12.1.15)	04 Aug 2019
3.4	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.4 IALA Workshop on Cyber Security	08 Aug 2019
3.5	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.5 Discussion of S-125 development	30 Sep 2019
3.6	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.6 MRN guideline for AtoN Domain	30 Sep 2019
3.7	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.7 S-201 Test bed Project of ROK	30 Sep 2019
3.8	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.8 Update of S-201 AtoN Product Specification	30 Sep 2019
3.9	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.9 Marking of Breakwaters - by Korea and Australia	30 Sep 2019
3.10	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.10 Providing Standardized Real-time Hydrological and Meteorological Information In Port Waters	30 Sep 2019
3.11	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.11 REVISED Practice on ATON distribution during freeze-up in the north China Sea Rev1	09 Oct 2019
3.12	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.12 Liaison Note from VTS47 on IALA Cyber Security Workshop	30 Sep 2019

3.13	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.13 Liaison Note to ARM Marking of Mooring Buoys	09 Oct 2019
3.14	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.14 Liaison Note to ARM Port Traffic Signals	09 Oct 2019
3.15	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.15 Liaison Note to All Committees on Tidal Display Signal System	09 Oct 2019
3.15.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.15.1 Annex 1 - Draft Guideline on Tidal Current Signal System	09 Oct 2019
3.16	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.16 Liaison Note to ARM on Heritage Nominations	09 Oct 2019
3.17	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.17 Liaison Note to ARM on Proposal on Auto Releasing Wreck Marking Buoy	09 Oct 2019
3.17.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.17.1 Annex 1 - The Development of Auto Releasing New Danger Mark Buoy	09 Oct 2019
3.18	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.18 Introduction to SMART-Navigation Services_1.0	09 Oct 2019
3.19	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.19 Liaison Note to ARM on a statement from ITU to IALA on Assignment and use of identities in the maritime mobile service for AMRD Group B	11 Oct 2019
3.19.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.19.1 Working document towards a preliminary draft revision of Annex 2 of Recommendation ITU-R M.585-7	11 Oct 2019
3.19.2	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.19.2 ITU Liaison Statement to IALA on the revision of Recommendation ITU-R M.585-7	11 Oct 2019
3.20	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.20 Liaison Note to ARM on statement from IALA to ITU on working document towards a preliminary draft revision of Rec ITU-R M.1371-5	11 Oct 2019
3.20.1	<b>3. Review of input papers</b> ARM10-3.20.1 Liaison Statement to ITU on working document towards a preliminary draft revision of Recommendation ITU-R M.1371	11 Oct 2019
4.2.1	<b>4. Reports from other bodies</b> ARM10-4.2.1 Report Council 69 Final	04 Aug 2019
4.2.2	<b>4. Reports from other bodies</b> ARM10-4.2.2 IALA report on MSC101	08 Aug 2019
7.1	<b>7. Work Programme (2018 - 2022)</b> ARM10-7.1 Committee Work Programme for 2018-2022	04 Aug 2019
7.2	<b>7. Work Programme (2018 - 2022)</b> ARM10-7.2 ARM Task Plan	04 Aug 2019
8.1	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.1 WP MBS Review gap analysis initial (ARM9-12.2.9)	04 Aug 2019
8.2	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.2 WP 1078 - The use of AtoN in the design or fairways (ARM9-12.2.10)	04 Aug 2019
8.3	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.3 WP Draft Guideline G1081-Ed.1.1 Provision of Virtual Aids to Navigation May2013 (ex ARM9-12.2.10bis)	04 Aug 2019
8.4	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.4 WP Draft IALA Guideline on MAtON (ARM9-12.2.11)	04 Aug 2019
8.5	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.5 WP NCA Input paper proposal MAtON symbol (ARM9-12.2.13)	04 Aug 2019
8.6	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.6 WP RPT-02-MB-19 Mobile AtoN light character trial report v1.0 (ARM9-12.2.14)	04 Aug 2019
8.7	<b>8. WG1 - Navigational requirements</b> ARM10-8.7 WP DRAFT-1116-Ed.1-Selection-of-Rhythmic-Characters-and-Synchronisation-of-AtoN (ARM9-12.2.15)	04 Aug 2019

9.1	<b>9. WG2 - Information Services and Portrayal</b> ARM10-9.1 WP - Draft Guidelines on Maritime Services (ARM9-12.2.16)	04 Aug 2019
9.2	<b>9. WG2 - Information Services and Portrayal</b> ARM10-9.2 WP- Ship Reporting TG Summary of ARM9 Discussions v1.3 (ARM9-12.2.17)	04 Aug 2019
9.3	<b>9. WG2 - Information Services and Portrayal</b> ARM10-9.3 WP Draft S-201 Annex C - Implementation guide (ARM9-12.2.24)	04 Aug 2019
10.1	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.1 WP IALA Guideline RiskManagement 1018 (ARM9-12.2.18)	04 Aug 2019
10.2	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.2 WP Guideline 1123 Ed1 The use of IWRAP MKII-June 2017 (ARM9-12.2.19)	04 Aug 2019
10.3	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.3 WP Guideline 1124 Ed1 The use of PAWSA MKII June 2017 (ARM9-12.2.20)	04 Aug 2019
10.4	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.4 WP Guideline 1138 Ed.1 The use of SIRA Dec2017 (ARM9-12.2.21)	04 Aug 2019
10.5	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.5 WP Recommendation RO138 (O-138) Ed1 Use of GIS and Simulation by AtoN Authorities Dec 2007 (ARM9-12.2.22)	04 Aug 2019
10.6	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.6 WP Guideline G1058 Ed.2 (ARM9-12.2.23)	04 Aug 2019
10.7	<b>10. WG3 - Risk management</b> ARM10-10.7 WP Draft Guideline 1097 Ed.1.1 Technical Features and Technology Relevant for Simulation of AtoN-working (ARM9-3.9.1)	04 Aug 2019
14.1	<b>14. Report of Meeting</b> ARM10-14.1 Report of ARM10	30 Oct 2019